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hevelone:  You call yourself a “born-
again Catholic in the Jesuit and Pentecos-
tal traditions.” Could you say a bit more 
about what those four descriptors mean, 
and how you see them as being related?

diiulio:  The Catholic part of it is prob-
ably the easiest part, although, for most 
people, it would probably be the most 
complicated part. I’m a cradle Catholic. I 
have never thought of myself as anything 
other than a Catholic. Even when I wasn’t 
going to church or very serious about 
religion (any religion—including Ca-
tholicism), I never went through a phase 
where I rejected the Church. I had my 
complaints and so forth like everybody 
else—or just about everybody else—but I 
have always considered myself Catholic, 
the way I consider myself born Italian 
and working class.

The born-again part—which is linked to 
the Pentecostal—is a little more compli-
cated. Around Palm Sunday in 1996 I 
resolved that my work on “faith-based” 
initiatives was not going to be, or remain, 
mainly an academic or professional 
occupation. It was going to be a life’s 
work in the sense that I would make it a 
vocation. I also resolved that I would try 
not to make any money off it. If I received 
an honorarium or its equivalent, I’d make 
sure that if it was received through deal-
ing with religion or religious nonprofits 

that serve the poor, I would fork the 
honoraria over.

One of the more powerful evangelical in-
fluences at this time was the Pentecostal 
tradition—especially the black Pentecos-
tal tradition, and within that the Church 

of God in Christ. In places like Philadel-
phia, that means pastors like Benjamin 
Smith and churches like Deliverance 
Evangelistic Church. They are part of a 
Holy Spirit, Pentecostal, high-octane tra-
dition, and that wing of the black church 
really got into my soul.

It did not lead me, however, to become a 
Pentecostal. It led me back to my Catholic 
faith and to the Jesuits, who seemed to 
me to have almost absolutely everything 

right. Through the example of St. Igna-
tius of Loyola, the Jesuits demonstrated 
St. James’ notion that faith without works 
is dead: Do it, show it, don’t just tell it. 
Also, the idea of having to be spiritually 
disciplined enough so as to act in the 
way that Christ would have you act—in 
compassion and truth. You don’t have to 
spend all your time being pious and pray-
ing—you can actually witness through 
your works.

hevelone: How do you shift that to 
the arena of public policy and public life?

diiulio: For me, it has meant that I 
am somewhat radically committed to the 
idea that sacred places should serve civic 
purposes, and that any government sup-
port for religious nonprofit organizations 
has to be ecumenical; it must be open to 
religious, secular, public and private. It is 
incumbent upon those of us who do have 
faith convictions and who participate 
in the public square to be nonsectarian 
in that context, to accept Methodists, 
Muslims, Mormons, Quakers, Catholics, 
Jews, Jehovah’s Witnesses, Anglicans and 
atheists.

Subsidiarity is a nice Catholic doctrine 
that travels well as a bridge to policy 
and public life. It says charity begins at 
home—it should start with the individ-
ual, the family, the church. If they don’t 
work, then we move into local and state 
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government; if necessary, we call upon 
the national government, but always with 
a mind toward having it help you deliver 
assistance in a way that’s up-close and 
personal, if and when possible.

hevelone:  
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The not-so-good news is, first, that the 
number of such organizations that are 
now receiving actual governmental 
support—whether financial, technical, 
etc.—has increased only very slightly. 
Second, those organizations that were 
interested five or six or seven years ago 
have now been, if not somewhat demor-
alized, then somewhat demobilized. 
Third, some extraordinarily good ideas, 
like ones involving the creation of an 
adult mentoring program to help the two 
million children who on any given day 
have a mom or dad incarcerated, have not 
really been implemented to the fullest. 
Nevertheless, I am cautiously optimistic. 
I think the next president—whoever he 
or she may be—will take up this issue. 
They will, of course, give it their own ac-
cent and emphasis, but will—I hope—do 
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that there is no way to wholesale human 
relationships. Everything has to be done 
at the retail level—up close and person-
al—when at all possible. I realize you 
can’t meet and greet everybody, every day, 
but you’ve got to understand how the pro-
gram will impact the lives of the people 
who stand to benefit the most. This holds 
true whether you’re doing social program 
development or implementation; or fram-
ing a public policy that’s going to impact 
simultaneously hundreds of thousands, 
if not millions, of lives; or simply trying 
to give money in a way that leverages 
resources to reap lots more social or civic 
good. If you don’t know the people affect-
ed, it rarely—if ever— goes well.

This is not to say that everybody needs 
to work in a soup kitchen, or be a Big 
Brother or Big Sister, or get involved in 
a youth volunteer adoption partnership 
program, or anything of the kind. But it 
is to say that the same sensibility and the 
same prudence and wit that you bring to 
bear on your everyday life—whether as a 
businessperson, or as a research scholar, 
or as an administrator, or whatever your 
wealth or excellence or endeavor—you 

a bit much. But boy, Augustine and lots 
of other things take on a lot more mean-
ing when you’re dealing viscerally with 
life dramas and problems to which you’re 
making an affirmative commitment. It is 
not just talk about, where does this idea 
of preferential love for the poor come 
from, but the reality of spending eight 
hours a day doing it together, and maybe 
doing it in interfaith and ecumenical 
partnerships, and then spending the eve-
ning talking about it and debriefing and 
reflecting. I don’t think there’s anything 
better. Romans 8:28, to me, is a counsel 
to do such work, and do it in public-pri-
vate and religious-secular partnerships: 
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