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owens:  Iran provides an important ex-
ample of the move toward democracy and 
modernization in the Islamic world. It’s 
unique in some ways and similar to the 
recent Arab movements in other ways. I 
wonder if you might start by comment-
ing on the status of the Iranian mode of 
Islamic democracy today.

peterson:  Iran set a precedent in 1979 
with the Islamic Revolution, which was 
meant to be both Islamic and democratic 
at the same time (hence the title, the Is-
lamic Republic, which is still used to de-
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going to attack us, or they’re both going 
to attack us.” So our own noise about 
this issue is what’s going to convince the 
Iranians, one way or the other, to go for a 
nuclear weapon.

owens:  One last question. Speaking 
of bloviation, Ahmadinejad is frequently 
lampooned here in the U.S. as much as 
he’s demonized for his semi- coherent 
exhortations on the lack of homosexuals 
in Iran or his Holocaust denial. Is he 
crazy like a fox? What is your sense of his 
coherence and political sensibility?

peterson:  He’s very smart. He also, 
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